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SEALER WITH CONTINUOUS MOTION 
ULTRASONIC ZIPPER WELDING 

BACKGROUND OF THE INVENTION 

This invention generally relates to methods and apparatus 
for manufacturing plastic Zippered bags of the type in which 
material, Such as foodstuff and detergent, are Stored. 

Reclosable bags are finding ever-growing acceptance as 
primary packaging, particularly as packaging for foodstuffs 
Such as cereal, fresh vegetables, Snacks and the like. Such 
bags provide the consumer with the ability to readily Store, 
in a closed, if not Sealed, package any unused portion of the 
packaged product even after the package is initially opened. 

Reclosable plastic Zipper assemblies are useful for Sealing 
thermoplastic pouches or bags. Typically, the plastic Zippers 
include a pair of interlockable profiled members that form a 
closure. AS the Slider moves across the closure members, the 
profiles are opened or closed. The profiles in plastic Zippers 
can take on various configurations, e.g. interlocking rib and 
groove elements having So-called male and female profiles, 
interlocking alternating hook-shaped closure elements, etc. 

Machinery for continuously manufacturing Zippered bags 
at high Speed is well known. A typical pre-made bag System 
comprises a Station for continuously paying out a web of bag 
making film from a roll; a folding mechanism for folding the 
film; a Station for continuously paying out a Zipper tape and 
inserting the tape between the opposing walls of the folded 
bag making film in the machine direction; a Station for 
continuously conduction heat Sealing the Zipper tape to both 
walls of the bag making film; a station for ultrasonically 
welding the Zipper at regular package width intervals, a 
Station for cross Sealing (again using heat conduction) the 
Zipper/film assembly at the same regular package width 
intervals to form Side Seals, and a Station for cutting the 
Zipper/film assembly along a midline of the Zipper crush and 
the croSS Seal to Sever a bag from the remainder of the film. 
In a known pre-made bag System, the film moves continu 
ously through the Zipper Sealing Station, but intermittently 
through the ultrasonic welding, croSS Sealing and cutting 
Stations. This transition is effectuated by a Synchronization 
Section having motor-driven pinch rolls and a dancer that 
converts continuous motion into Start-Stop motion. 
Known pre-made bag Systems of the above-described 

type can produce bags at a rate of 200 bags per minute. It 
would be desirable to increase the production rate of Such 
pre-made bag Systems. The limiting factor in Speed is the 
time required to perform an ultrasonic crush of the Zipper 
tape. Thus there is a need for an apparatus for ultraSonically 
welding the Zipper that can operate at faster Speeds. 

BRIEF DESCRIPTION OF THE INVENTION 

The invention is directed to a method and an apparatus for 
producing Zippered bags at faster Speeds. This is accom 
plished by Speeding up the ultrasonic welding operation. 
More specifically, ultrasonic welding is performed continu 
ously while the web of bag making film and the Zipper tape 
are moving, instead of being performed while the film and 
Zipper tape are Stopped. To facilitate this improvement, the 
ultraSonic welding Station is moved from the bag machine, 
where the bag making film and Zipper tape move 
intermittently, to the Sealer frame, where the film and Zipper 
tape move continuously. 
One aspect of the invention is a method comprising the 

following Steps: continuously moving a thermoplastic Zipper 
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2 
tape along a path; and ultraSonically welding the Zipper tape 
at Successive Spaced Zones along its length at a rate of 
welding while the Zipper tape is moving along the path. 

Another aspect of the invention is a method comprising 
the following Steps: incrementally inserting a thermoplastic 
Zipper tape between opposing edges of a folded web of 
thermoplastic bag making film; continuously moving the 
folded web and the inserted Zipper tape together along a 
path; incrementally Sealing the inserted Zipper tape to the 
folded web of bag making film in a lengthwise direction of 
the Zipper tape while the Zipper tape and the web of bag 
making film are moving together, the incremental Sealing 
occurring along a first Segment of the path; and ultrasoni 
cally welding the Zipper tape and adjoining web portions at 
Successive Spaced Zones while the Zipper tape and the web 
of bag making film are moving together, the ultraSonic 
welding occurring along a Second Segment of the path 
Spaced apart from the first Segment. 
A further aspect of the invention is an apparatus compris 

ing: a welding Station comprising first and Second rotary 
elements arranged with mutually parallel axes of rotation, 
the first and Second rotary elements comprising respective 
peripheries that are in mutual opposition at a gap; a trans 
ducer for converting electric potential differences into ultra 
Sound wave energy, the first rotary element being acousti 
cally coupled to the transducer, drive means for causing the 
first and Second rotary elements to rotate in opposite direc 
tions, means for continuously moving a thermoplastic Zipper 
tape along a path that passes through the gap between the 
first and Second rotary elements, and means for acoustically 
coupling acoustic wave energy from the first rotary element 
into the Zipper tape at Spaced intervals along the Zipper tape. 

Another aspect of the invention is an apparatus for 
continuously Sealing a thermoplastic Zipper tape inside 
opposing edges of a folded web of thermoplastic bag making 
film. The apparatus comprises: a first pair of mutually 
opposing Sealing bars for incrementally Sealing the Zipper 
tape to the folded web of bag making film in a lengthwise 
direction of the Zipper tape while the Zipper tape and the 
folded web are moving together; and rotary ultrasonic 
apparatus for ultraSonically welding the Zipper tape and 
adjoining portions of the folded web at Successive Spaced 
Zones along the Zipper tape at a rate of welding while the 
Sealed Zipper tape/web assembly is moving. 

Yet another aspect of the invention is an apparatus com 
prising: means for continuously moving a web of thermo 
plastic bag making film and a thermoplastic Zipper tape 
together in adjoining relationship; a Stationary conduction 
heat Sealer arranged to continuously Seal the Zipper tape to 
the web of bag making film while the Zipper tape and the 
web are moving, first and Second rotary elements arranged 
with mutually parallel axes of rotation and with peripheral 
Surfaces Separated by a gap through which the Zipper tape 
and adjoining portions of the web pass, the first rotary 
element comprising a protuberance on its periphery, the 
protuberance passing through the gap during rotation of the 
first rotary element; and an ultraSonic transducer for con 
Verting electrical energy into ultraSonic wave energy, 
wherein the ultraSonic transducer is acoustically coupled to 
one of the first and Second rotary elements. 

Other aspects of the invention are disclosed and claimed 
below. 

BRIEF DESCRIPTION OF THE DRAWINGS 

FIG. 1 is a drawing showing a side View of a continuous 
Sealing machine having apparatus for continuous ultrasonic 
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welding of Zipper tape in accordance with one embodiment 
of the invention. 

FIG. 2 is a drawing showing, on an enlarged Scale, the 
rotary elements for ultraSonic welding incorporated in the 
Sealing machine depicted in FIG. 1. 

FIG. 3 is a block diagram depicting additional compo 
nents of the rotary ultraSonic welding apparatus in accor 
dance with the embodiment depicted in FIG. 2. 

DETAILED DESCRIPTION OF THE 
INVENTION 

The method and apparatus of the present invention will 
now be described with reference to FIGS. 1 and 2. FIG. 1 
shows a Zipper tape-to-film Sealing apparatus that works in 
conjunction with a bag making machine. In particular, the 
Sealing apparatus disclosed herein can be used in conjunc 
tion with a pre-made bag machine, i.e., a machine that makes 
bags but does not fill them. 

Referring to FIG. 1, pre-folded web 2 of bag making film 
is paid out from a roll 4 and a Zipper tape 8 is inserted 
between the walls of the folded web by a tape inserter 6. The 
Zipper tape and folded web are then threaded through a 
Sealing station (12a, b, 14a,b), an ultrasonic welding Station 
(26, 28), and a pair of motor-driven pinch rolls 34 and 36. 
Typically the pinch rolls 34 and 36, which pull the film 2 
through the Sealing and ultraSonic welding Stations, are part 
of the bag making machine. AS an alternative to paying out 
a pre-folded web 2 of bag making film, film that is not folded 
can be wound on roll 4. In this case, a conventional folding 
board or plow would be installed between the roll 4 and the 
tape inserter 6. 

The Zipper tape is unwound from a spool (not shown) and 
guided into position by the tape inserter 6, which comprises 
a channel having a croSS-Sectional profile shaped to maintain 
the orientation of the Zipper tape 8 as it is fed toward the 
folded web 2. The outlet end of the tape inserter 6 is 
designed to Separate the opposing edges of the folded web 
by a Sufficient distance to allow the emerging Zipper tape 8 
to be inserted therebetween and in parallel with the opposing 
edgeS. Sets of opposing guide rollers may be provided at any 
points downstream of the tape inserter to maintain the 
position of the inserted Zipper tape 8 in parallel with and 
sandwiched between the opposing walls of the folded web 4. 

The folded web 2 and the Zipper tape 8 are then advanced 
together through the Vertical Sealing apparatus comprising a 
first pair of opposing heated Sealing bars 12a and 12b and a 
Second pair of opposing heated Sealing bars 14a and 14b. 
The Sealing bars 12a and 14a are laterally displaceable, as 
are the Sealing bars 14a and 14b, between respective 
extended and retracted positions. Sealing of the Zipper tape 
to the folded web of bag making film occurs while the 
Sealing bars are in their respective extended positions. The 
Sealing bars are retracted as needed, e.g., during threading of 
the web and tape through the Sealing apparatus prior to 
Startup. 

Although not shown in FIG. 1, each Sealing bar may be 
mounted to a laterally displaceable Seal bar mounting plate 
via a pair of threaded rods, while the Sealbar mounting plate 
is in turn fastened to the ends of a pair of guide shafts 
respectively Supported by a pair of flanged mount bearings. 
The flanged mount bearings sit atop and are fastened to a 
cylinder mounting plate. The force for displacing the Sealing 
bar is provided by an air cylinder having a piston, the end of 
which is fastened to the middle of the seal bar mounting 
plate. 
As the folded web 2 with inserted Zipper tape 8 advances 

Vertically and continuously between the opposing Sets of 
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4 
Sealing bars, the respective Zipper flanges of the Zipper tape 
are Sealed to the opposing edges of the bag making film, 
thereby continuously attaching incoming Sections of the 
moving Zipper tape to adjoining Sections of the moving web. 
The Sealing is accomplished by electrically heating the 
Sealing bars, the heat being conducted through respective 
endless barrier strips 16a and 16b made of Teflon or similar 
material, which circulate on respective Sets of rollers. Teflon 
barrier strip 16a passes between one side of the folded web 
and the sealing bars 12a and 14a, while Teflon barrier strip 
16b passes between the other side of the folded web and the 
Sealing bars 12b and 14b. In the gaps between the opposing 
Sealing bars, the web and Zipper tape are Sandwiched 
between and held together by the Teflon barrier strips 16a 
and 16b, which move with the web and Zipper tape and 
prevent the bag making film from Sticking against the 
Stationary heated Sealing bars during conduction heat Seal 
ing. The Teflon barrier Strips and intervening web and Zipper 
tape pass through the nips of a Series of guide rollers 
respectively positioned in advance of the Sealing bars (guide 
rollers 18a and 18b); in between the sealing bars (guide 
rollers 19a and 19b); and after the sealing bars (guide rollers 
20a and 20b). It should be appreciated that for the sake of 
illustration, the Teflon barrier strips, the folded web and the 
Sealing bars are shown in FIG. 1 with respective gaps 
between adjoining components, whereas in reality these 
components are in contact with each other when the Sealing 
bars are in their extended positions. Likewise the nips 
formed by the opposing pairs of guide rollers have been 
shown in the drawing with gaps, when in actuality the Teflon 
barrier Strips and the web with inserted Zipper tape are 
preSSed together in the nipS and no gaps occur. 

In one implementation, each Sealing bar is about 6 inches 
long and the Teflon barrier strips are about 1.5 inches wide. 
Both the Teflon barrier strips 16a and 16b and the guide 
rollers 18a, 18b, 19a, 19b, 20a and 20b are disposed in the 
area of the Zipper tape and do not extend the full height (i.e., 
the dimension transverse to the Zipper tape) of the folded bag 
making film. 

Although the embodiment shown in FIG. 1 has two 
Sealing bars arranged in Series on each side of the traveling 
web and Zipper tape, any number of Sealing bars can be used 
provided that Sufficient heat is conducted into the Zipper tape 
to cause the Zipper flanges to Seal to the bag making film. 

Typically each Sealing bar assembly comprises a Seal bar 
core, a Seal bar cap having a Sealing bar projecting 
therefrom, an insulator, and another Seal bar cap separated 
from the seal bar core by the insulator. The seal bar cap is 
fastened to the ends of the previously mentioned threaded 
rods. The Seal bar core has a pair of longitudinal channels 
that respectively house a thermocouple and an electric heater 
(neither of which are shown in the drawings), both of which 
are electrically connected to a programmable heat controller 
(not shown) by electrical wiring (not shown). The thermo 
couple produces electrical Signals representing the tempera 
ture of the Seal bar core, which Signals are received by the 
heat controller. The heat controller controls the level of 
electrical current Supplied to the heater in accordance with 
a heat control program that is designed to maintain the 
Sealing bar temperature within limits preset by the System 
operator. In particular, the temperature of the Sealing bar 
must be Selected Such that the amount of heat conducted 
through the bag making film and into the adjoining Zipper 
flange, during the time that the Zipper flanges and film are 
pressed between the extended Sealing bars, will achieve the 
desired result, namely, Sealing of the Zipper flange to the bag 
making film without "seal-through' of the Zipper flanges, 
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i.e., Sealing of the Zipper flanges to each other. The Zipper 
flanges may be laminated with high-melting-point thermo 
plastic material on their confronting Sides to prevent "Seal 
through' of the Zipper flanges. 

The Zipper tape and folded web that enter the Sealing 
Station unjoined, exit the Sealing Station joined together by 
permanent seals. The pinch rolls 34 and 36 (which form part 
of the bag making machine) continue to pull the joined 
Zipper tape and web forward. On the way to the bag making 
machine, the joined Zipper tape/film assembly pass through 
a rotary ultraSonic apparatus comprising a horn 26 and an 
anvil 28, which are shown on a larger scale in FIG. 2. Either 
both the horn and the anvil rotate, or one rotates while the 
other does not rotate. In the disclosed embodiment, both the 
horn and the anvil are rotated. A photodetector 24 positioned 
in the vicinity of the rotary ultraSonic apparatus receives 
radiant energy that has been transmitted by a light Source 
(not shown) and reflected off an opposing portion of the 
moving web of film. The web of film is marked at regular 
Spaced intervals in the Zone where the radiant energy from 
the light Source impinges. The marks absorb the transmitted 
radiant energy, producing a distinctive electrical Signal in the 
photodetector 24 each instant when a mark passes by. The 
time intervals between the detection signals corresponding 
to equally Spaced marks on the film are a function of the 
Speed of the film. Thus, the output of detection Signals from 
the photodetector 24 to a programmable controller (42 in 
FIG. 3) allows the latter to control the rotation of the rotary 
elements 26 and 28 so that the peripheries of each rotary 
element have a tangential Velocity component, during the 
welding portion of the work cycle, that is approximately 
equal to the linear speed of the moving Zipper tape/web 
assembly. A perSon Skilled in the art will appreciate that 
other detection means could be employed instead of a 
photo-optical eye to detect the Speed of the moving film. For 
example, an encoder wheel that produces a number of 
Signals or pulses every revolution may be placed So that its 
periphery engages the moving web of film and rotates due to 
the frictional force exerted by the moving film. The photo 
eye, in concert with the encoder, can be used to correctly 
place the crush on the Zippered film. 

In the disclosed embodiment, rotary element 26 is a horn 
acoustically coupled to an ultraSonic transducer and rotary 
element 28 is an anvil. The rotary ultrasonic apparatus is 
mounted on a movable frame (not shown) in order to register 
the Weld or crush in the correct position on the Zipper 
tape/bag film assembly. AS best Seen in FIG. 2, the rotary 
anvil 28 comprises a protuberance or land 30 that projects 
radially outward from a circular cylindrical peripheral Sur 
face. A weld 32 is made on the Zipper tape each time the 
protuberance 30 passes through the gap between the rotating 
horn and anvil and presses the Zipper tape, provided that the 
horn 26 is energized. The Zipper tape and adjoining portions 
of the web are pressed between the protuberance 30 and the 
energized horn 26, thereby acoustically coupling the ther 
moplastic material of the Zipper tape and film to the circular 
cylindrical peripheral surface of the horn. The amplitude of 
the acoustic wave energy is adequate to cause thermoplastic 
material to Soften or melt at the interface of the Zipper flange 
and the bag film, thereby forming a permanent Seal when the 
fused material is cooled. When the protuberance 30 is not in 
the gap between the horn and the anvil, there is Sufficient 
clearance for the Zipper tape and folded web to pass through 
the gap without matching the Speed of the moving tape/web 
assembly. 

Although the protuberance is on the rotary anvil in the 
disclosed embodiment, alternatively the protuberance could 
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6 
be located on the rotary horn instead. In either arrangement, 
the protuberance pressing the Zipper tape and film in the nip 
of the rotary ultrasonic apparatus establishes the acoustic 
coupling of the thermoplastic material of Zipper and film to 
the energized horn. Moreover, instead of a Single 
protuberance, two or more protuberances Spaced at equal 
angles on the periphery of either of the rotary elements can 
be provided. 

Female knurls may be formed on the contacting Surface of 
the protuberance 30 (see FIG. 2) to provide grooves for the 
thermoplastic material to flow into during welding, rather 
than being Squeezed out the Sides. The rotary horn 26 may 
also be provided with female knurls around its circumfer 
CCC. 

In one embodiment, the rotary horn and the rotary anvil 
can both be rotated continuously to effect welding at Spaced 
intervals along the length of the continuously moving Zipper 
tape. In the case of a Single protuberance, the middles of the 
welds will be Spaced at intervals approximately equal to the 
circumference of the rotary element that carries the protu 
berance. 

In accordance with the embodiment depicted in FIG. 3, 
the rotary elements 26 and 28 are driven to rotate by 
respective servomotors 46 and 44. These servomotors are 
controlled by a programmable controller 42 So that rotation 
of the driven rotary elements follows the speed of the film, 
i.e., the controller issues control Signals to the Servomotors 
that are a function of the film Speed indicating Signals 
received from the photodetector 24 (or other film speed 
detecting device). Preferably the rotary element that carries 
the acoustic coupling protuberance 30 (anvil 28 in the 
embodiment shown in FIG. 3) comes to rest during each 
work cycle and does not move until the controller 42 
receives a trigger Signal from the photodetector 24. The 
rotary element that does not carry the protuberance 30 (horn 
26 in FIG. 3) may be moving continuously or may comes to 
rest during each work cycle and not move until the controller 
42 receives the aforementioned trigger Signal from the 
photodetector 24. In either case, the servomotors 44 and 46 
are controlled by the controller 42. In the case where both 
rotary elements come to rest during each work cycle and do 
not move until the trigger Signal is received from the 
photodetector, optionally the rotary elements can be driven 
by a single Servomotor by coupling the driven rotary ele 
ment to the other rotary element by means of a drive belt. 

Still referring to FIG. 3, the horn 26 forms part of a radial 
actuator that further comprises an ultraSonic transducer 48 
that converts electrical energy provided by a power Supply 
50 into ultrasonic wave energy. Slip rings 52 connected to 
the ultrasonic mechanism are engaged by brushes 54 to 
provide electrical power to the transducer. The ultrasonic 
wave energy produced by transducer 48 is amplified by a 
booster 56 before passing to the horn 26. The horn 26 can 
rotate in the adjustable bracket 58 while mechanically 
Vibrating at a desired ultrasonic amplitude. UltraSonic vibra 
tion in the horn 26 is emitted in a radial direction through the 
circumference of the horn 26 to the thermoplastic material 
pressed against the circumference. Because the horn can roll 
tangentially with the thermoplastic material, drag and puck 
ering effects are eliminated. 

After ultraSonic welding, the Sealed and ultraSonically 
welded tape/film assembly travels to a pre-made bag 
machine (not shown). The tape/film assembly moves inter 
mittently through croSS Sealing and cutting Stations of the 
bag machine. The transition from continuous motion in the 
Sealing machine to intermittent motion in the bag machine is 
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effectuated by a Synchronization Section having motor 
driven pinch rolls 34 and 36 (see FIG. 1) and a dancer (not 
shown) that converts continuous motion into start-stop 
motion. In addition to the above, optionally the Synchroni 
Zation Section has Some device to further reduce the thick 
neSS of the welded material to facilitate the Subsequent 
cutting operation using a hot knife. The thickness of the Weld 
exiting the ultraSonic welding apparatus will equal the 
distance from protuberance 30 (see FIG. 2) to the horn 
circumference. 

While the invention has been described with reference to 
various embodiments, it will be understood by those skilled 
in the art that various changes may be made and equivalents 
may be Substituted for elements thereof without departing 
from the Scope of the invention. In addition, many modifi 
cations may be made to adapt a particular Situation to the 
teachings of the invention without departing from the essen 
tial scope thereof. Therefore it is intended that the invention 
not be limited to the particular embodiment disclosed as the 
best mode contemplated for carrying out this invention, but 
that the invention will include all embodiments falling 
within the Scope of the appended claims. 
What is claimed is: 
1. A method comprising the following Steps: 
(a) continuously moving a thermoplastic Zipper tape along 

a path; and 
(b) ultraSonically welding said Zipper tape at Successive 

Spaced Zones along its length at a rate of welding while 
Said Zipper tape is moving, Said ultrasonic welding 
occurring in a first Space along Said path. 

2. The method as recited in claim 1, wherein Said Zipper 
tape passes through a gap Separating first and Second rotary 
elements, further comprising the Step of energizing one of 
Said rotary elements with ultraSonic wave energy. 

3. The method as recited in claim 2, further comprising 
the Steps of causing Said first and Second rotary elements to 
rotate in opposite directions at respective rotational Speeds 
during a welding portion of each work cycle Such that their 
respective peripheries have respective tangential Velocity 
components approximately equal to the Speed at which said 
Zipper tape passes through Said gap. 

4. The method as recited in claim 3, further comprising 
the Steps of causing Said first rotary element to rotate during 
a non-welding portion of Said work cycle at rotational 
Speeds less than its rotational Speed during Said welding 
portion of Said work cycle, and causing Said Second rotary 
element to rotate during a non-welding portion of Said work 
cycle at a rotational Speed Substantially equal to its rotational 
Speed during Said welding portion of Said work cycle. 

5. The method as recited in claim 4, further comprising 
the Step of causing Said first rotary element to come to rest 
during Said non-welding portion of Said work cycle. 

6. The method as recited in claim 1, wherein said path of 
Said Zipper tape also passes through a Second Station, the 
method further comprising the following Steps: 

(c) continuously moving a web of thermoplastic bag 
making film along Said path; and 

(d) incrementally Sealing said Zipper tape to said web of 
bag making film in a lengthwise direction of Said Zipper 
tape while Said Zipper tape and Said web of bag making 
film are moving, Said incremental Sealing occurring in 
a Second Space along Said path, wherein Said first and 
Second Spaces have no Space in common. 

7. The method as recited in claim 6, further comprising 
detecting the Speed of Said continuously moving web of bag 
making film and controlling the rate of welding as a function 
of the detected Speed. 
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8 
8. The method as recited in claim 6, wherein said sealing 

Step comprises conduction heat Sealing. 
9. The method as recited in claim 6, further comprising 

the Steps of folding Said web of bag making film as it moves 
and inserting Said Zipper tape between opposing portions of 
Said folded web, Said Zipper tape being Sealed to Said 
opposing portions of Said web of bag making film during 
Step (d). 

10. A method comprising the following Steps: 
incrementally inserting a thermoplastic Zipper tape 

between opposing edges of a folded web of thermo 
plastic bag making film; 

continuously moving Said folded web and Said inserted 
Zipper tape together along a path; 

incrementally Sealing Said inserted Zipper tape to Said 
folded web of bag making film in a lengthwise direc 
tion of Said Zipper tape while Said Zipper tape and Said 
web of bag making film are moving together, Said 
incremental Sealing occurring along a first Segment of 
Said path; and 

ultrasonically welding Said Zipper tape and adjoining web 
portions at Successive Spaced Zones while Said Zipper 
tape and Said web of bag making film are moving 
together, Said ultraSonic welding occurring along a 
Second Segment of Said path, 

wherein Said first and Second Segments of Said path are 
Spaced apart. 

11. The method as recited in claim 10, further comprising 
detecting the Speed of Said continuously moving web of bag 
making film and controlling the rate of ultraSonic welding as 
a function of the detected speed. 

12. The method as recited in claim 10, wherein said 
Sealing Step comprises conduction heat Sealing. 

13. An apparatus comprising: 
a welding Station comprising first and Second rotary 

elements arranged with mutually parallel axes of 
rotation, Said first and Second rotary elements compris 
ing respective peripheries that are in mutual opposition 
at a gap, 

a transducer for converting electric potential differences 
into ultrasound wave energy, Said first rotary element 
being acoustically coupled to Said transducer, 

drive means for causing Said first and Second rotary 
elements to rotate in opposite directions, 

means for continuously moving a thermoplastic Zipper 
tape along a path that passes through Said gap between 
Said first and Second rotary elements, and 

means for acoustically coupling acoustic wave energy 
from Said first rotary element into Said Zipper tape at 
Spaced intervals along Said Zipper tape. 

14. The apparatus as recited in claim 13, wherein Said 
acoustic coupling means comprise a protuberance on the 
periphery of one of Said first and Second rotary elements, a 
Weld being made on Said Zipper tape each time Said protu 
berance engages Said Zipper tape during rotation of Said first 
and Second rotary elements while Said first rotary element is 
energized. 

15. The apparatus as recited in claim 14, wherein Said 
drive means comprise a servomotor for driving Said rotary 
element having Said protuberance to rotate, further compris 
ing a detector arranged to produce a signal indicating the 
Speed of Said continuously moving web of bag making film 
and a controller for controlling Said Servomotor to drive Said 
rotary element having Said protuberance to rotate with a 
tangential Velocity component approximately equal to Said 
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detected Web Speed in a phase of rotation when Said protu 
berance is in contact with Said moving web. 

16. The apparatus as recited in claim 15, wherein said 
detector comprises a photodetector arranged to receive radi 
ant energy reflected from Said web. 

17. The apparatus as recited in claim 15, wherein said 
detector comprises an encoder wheel having a periphery in 
contact with said web. 

18. The apparatus as recited in claim 13, further compris 
ing a controller for controlling Said drive means to rotate 
Said first and Second rotary elements in opposite directions 
at respective rotational Speeds during a welding portion of 
each work cycle Such that the peripheries of Said first and 
Second rotary elements have respective tangential Velocity 
components approximately equal to the Speed at which said 
Zipper tape is moving. 

19. The apparatus as recited in claim 13, further compris 
ing: 
means for inserting Said Zipper tape between opposing 

edges of a folded web of thermoplastic bag making 
film, Said continuous movement means thereafter con 
tinuously moving Said Zipper tape and Said web 
together; 

a Sealing Station comprising first and Second Sealing bars 
arranged in mutual opposition with a gap therebetween, 
Said continuously moving Zipper tape and adjoining 
portions of Said web passing through said gap between 
Said first and Second Sealing bars, and 

a heat controller for controlling the temperatures at the 
Surfaces of Said first and Second Sealing bars. 

20. An apparatus for continuously Sealing a thermoplastic 
Zipper tape inside opposing edges of a folded web of 
thermoplastic bag making film, comprising: 

a first pair of mutually opposing Sealing bars for incre 
mentally Sealing Said Zipper tape to Said folded web of 
bag making film in a lengthwise direction of Said Zipper 
tape while Said Zipper tape and Said folded web are 
moving together, and 

rotary ultraSonic apparatus for ultrasonically welding Said 
Zipper tape and adjoining portions of Said folded web at 
Successive Spaced Zones along Said Zipper tape at a rate 
of welding while Said Sealed Zipper tape/web assembly 
is moving. 

21. The apparatus as recited in claim 20, wherein Said 
rotary ultraSonic apparatus comprises first and Second rotary 
elements Separated by a gap, one of Said rotary elements 
comprising a protuberance on its periphery, Said Zipper tape 
being acoustically coupled to Said rotary ultraSonic appara 
tus only when Said protuberance is disposed in Said gap. 

22. The apparatus as recited in claim 21, further compris 
ing means for driving Said first and Second rotary elements 
to rotate in opposite directions at respective rotational 
Speeds during a welding portion of each work cycle Such that 
the peripheries of Said first and Second rotary elements have 
respective tangential Velocity components approximately 
equal to the Speed at which Said Sealed Zipper tape/web 
assembly is moving. 

23. The apparatus as recited in claim 22, wherein Said 
driving means comprise a servomotor for driving Said rotary 
element having Said protuberance to rotate. 

24. The apparatus as recited in claim 23, further compris 
ing a detector arranged to produce a signal indicating the 
Speed of Said continuously moving web of bag making film 
and a controller for controlling Said Servomotor as a function 
of Said Signal. 

25. An apparatus comprising: 
means for continuously moving a web of thermoplastic 
bag making film and a thermoplastic Zipper tape 
together in adjoining relationship; 
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10 
a Stationary conduction heat Sealer arranged to continu 

ously Seal Said Zipper tape to Said web of bag making 
film while Said Zipper tape and Said web are moving; 

first and Second rotary elements arranged with mutually 
parallel axes of rotation and with peripheral Surfaces 
Separated by a gap through which Said Zipper tape and 
adjoining portions of Said web pass, Said first rotary 
element comprising a protuberance on its periphery, 
Said protuberance passing through Said gap during 
rotation of Said first rotary element; and 

an ultraSonic transducer for converting electrical energy 
into ultraSonic wave energy, wherein Said ultrasonic 
transducer is acoustically coupled to one of Said first 
and Second rotary elements. 

26. The apparatus as recited in claim 25, wherein Said 
Zipper tape is ultraSonically welded between Said first and 
Second rotary elements after Said Zipper tape has been Sealed 
to said web. 

27. An apparatus comprising: 
a welding Station comprising first and Second elements, 

Said first element being rotatable and Said Second 
element being Separated from Said first element by a 
gap, 

a transducer for converting electric potential differences 
into ultrasound wave energy, one of Said first and 
Second elements being acoustically coupled to Said 
transducer, 

drive means for causing Said first element to rotate; and 
means for continuously moving a thermoplastic Zipper 

tape along a path that passes through Said gap between 
Said first and Second elements, 

wherein Said rotatable first element comprises a peripheral 
Structure that causes said moving Zipper tape to be 
periodically pressed between Said first and Second 
elements at Spaced intervals along Said Zipper tape, Said 
transducer providing ultrasound wave energy to Said 
one of Said first and Second elements acoustically 
coupled to Said transducer during Said periodic appli 
cations of pressure. 

28. The apparatus as recited in claim 27, wherein said 
Second element is rotatable. 

29. The apparatus as recited in claim 27, wherein said 
peripheral Structure comprises a protuberance, a weld being 
made on Said Zipper tape each time Said protuberance 
engages Said Zipper tape during rotation of Said first element 
and while Said transducer is energized. 

30. The apparatus as recited in claim 27, wherein said 
drive means comprise a Servomotor for driving Said first 
element to rotate with a tangential Velocity component 
approximately equal to the Speed of Said Zipper tape. 

31. The apparatus as recited in claim 27, further compris 
ing: 
means for inserting Said Zipper tape between opposing 

edges of a folded web of thermoplastic bag making 
film, Said continuous movement means thereafter con 
tinuously moving Said Zipper tape and Said web 
together; 

a Sealing Station comprising first and Second Sealing bars 
arranged in mutual opposition with a gap therebetween, 
Said continuously moving Zipper tape and adjoining 
portions of Said web passing through said gap between 
Said first and Second Sealing bars, and 

a heat controller for controlling the temperatures at the 
Surfaces of Said first and Second Sealing bars. 

k k k k k 
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